

Bid Tabulation
17-010S - Music Instruments and Equipment RFP

Solicitation: 17-010S Music Instruments and Equipment
 Closed: December 12, 2016, 2:00 PM

Item #	Description	UOM	QTY	Alamo Music Center	Antonio Strad Violin	B & H Foto and Electronics Corp	Cascio Interstate Music Inc. dba Interstate Music	High School Music Service, Inc	Hillje Music Centers, LLC	Music and Arts Center	Nick Rail Music	Pender's Music Company	Peripole, Inc.	Romeo Music	Sam Ash QuikShip Corp	Suzuki Music USA	Terra Nova Violins	Texas Scenic Company, Inc.	Universal Melody Services	Washington Music Sales Center	Wenger Corporation	Woodwind & Brasswind, Inc.
Est Total Award				\$ -	\$ 25,130.00	\$ -	\$ 112,325.30	\$ 1,799.00	\$ -	\$ 224,009.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ -	\$ 9,809.91	\$ -	\$ 510.00	\$ -	\$ 33,520.00	\$ 8,832.00	\$ -	\$ 5,070.00	\$ 65,238.00	\$ 3,438.00
A. Woodwind Instruments																						
A.1	Piccolo, Yamaha YPC-81 or Approved Equal	EA	2		No Bid	No Bid						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each			\$ 2,491.00			\$ 2,432.90	\$ 2,489.00	\$ 2,529.00	\$ 2,426.00	\$ 2,480.00				\$ 2,570.00					\$ 2,473.00		\$ 2,690.00
	Extended Total			\$ 4,982.00			\$ 4,865.80	\$ 4,978.00	\$ 5,058.00	\$ 4,852.00	\$ 4,960.00				\$ 5,140.00					\$ 4,946.00		\$ 5,380.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# PICYPC81 Mfg# YPC								Yamaha YPC-81							
A.2	Flute, Yamaha YFL-262Y or Approved Equal	EA	4		No Bid	No Bid						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each			\$ 531.00			\$ 519.90	\$ 542.00	\$ 529.00	\$ 511.00	\$ 528.00				\$ 545.00					\$ 527.00		\$ 540.00
	Extended Total			\$ 2,124.00			\$ 2,079.60	\$ 2,168.00	\$ 2,116.00	\$ 2,044.00	\$ 2,112.00				\$ 2,180.00					\$ 2,108.00		\$ 2,160.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# FLUYFL262Y Mfg# YFL262				YFL-262				Yamaha YFL-262							
	Delivery			14 Days					1-3 wks													
A.3	Flute, Yamaha YFL-382 or Approved Equal	EA	2		No Bid	No Bid						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each			\$ 748.00			\$ 723.90	\$ 749.00	\$ 739.00	\$ 720.00	\$ 735.00				\$ 781.00					\$ 734.00		\$ 820.00
	Extended Total			\$ 1,496.00			\$ 1,447.80	\$ 1,498.00	\$ 1,478.00	\$ 1,440.00	\$ 1,470.00				\$ 1,562.00					\$ 1,468.00		\$ 1,640.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# FLUYFL382Y Mfg# YFL38		Not YFL-302H						Yamaha YFL-382							
A.4	Clarinet, Buffet E-11 or Approved Equal	EA	4		No Bid	No Bid						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each			\$ 721.00			\$ 647.90	\$ 739.00	\$ 726.00	\$ 729.00					\$ 785.00					\$ 719.00		\$ 762.00
	Extended Total			\$ 1,442.00			\$ 1,295.80	\$ 1,478.00	\$ 1,452.00	\$ 1,458.00					\$ 1,570.00					\$ 1,438.00		\$ 1,524.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# BCLBC250150S Mfg# WSLES				BC2501N-5-0				Buffet E-11							
A.5	Bassoon, Selmer 1432 or Approved Equal	EA	2		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid				No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each			\$ 3,478.00			\$ 3,848.90	\$ 3,499.00	\$ 3,366.00	\$ 3,574.00					\$ 3,674.00					\$ 3,415.00		\$ 3,815.00
	Extended Total			\$ 6,956.00			\$ 7,697.80	\$ 6,998.00	\$ 6,732.00	\$ 7,148.00					\$ 7,348.00					\$ 6,830.00		\$ 7,630.00
	Brand / Model			Selmer 1432 B			Cascio# BAS1432B Mfg# 1432B				#1432B				Selmer 1432B							
A.6	Alto Saxophone, Yamaha YAS-26 or Approved Equal	EA	4		No Bid	No Bid						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each			\$ 989.00			\$ 837.90	\$ 989.00	\$ 989.00	\$ 955.00	\$ 960.00				\$ 849.00					\$ 808.00		\$ 1,001.00
	Extended Total			\$ 3,956.00			\$ 3,351.60	\$ 3,956.00	\$ 3,956.00	\$ 3,820.00	\$ 3,840.00				\$ 3,396.00					\$ 3,232.00		\$ 4,004.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# EASYAS26C Mfg# YAS26C				Sub: YAS-200ADII *See Spec Sheets				Yamaha YAS-26							
A.7	Alto Saxophone, Yamaha YAS-480 or Approved Equal	EA	2		No Bid	No Bid						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each			\$ 1,698.00			\$ 1,655.90	\$ 1,698.00	\$ 1,699.00	\$ 1,660.00	\$ 1,694.00				\$ 1,774.00					\$ 1,690.00		\$ 1,730.00
	Extended Total			\$ 3,396.00			\$ 3,311.80	\$ 3,396.00	\$ 3,398.00	\$ 3,320.00	\$ 3,388.00				\$ 3,548.00					\$ 3,380.00		\$ 3,460.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# EASYAS480 Mfg# YAS480C								Yamaha YAS-480							
B - Brass Instruments																						
B.1	Trumpet, Yamaha YRT-2330 or Approved Equal	EA	4		No Bid	No Bid						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each			\$ 521.00			\$ 1,735.60	\$ 517.00	\$ 519.00	\$ 497.00	\$ 499.00				\$ 469.00					\$ 422.00		\$ 520.00
	Extended Total			\$ 2,084.00			\$ 6,942.40	\$ 2,068.00	\$ 2,076.00	\$ 1,988.00	\$ 1,996.00				\$ 1,876.00					\$ 1,688.00		\$ 2,080.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# BTRYTR2330 Mfg# YTR2330C			current model YTR-2330	Sub: YTR-200ADII *See Spec Sheets				Yamaha YTR-2330							
B.2	Tuba, Yamaha YBB-321 WC or Approved Equal	EA	13		No Bid	No Bid						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each			\$ 4,478.00			\$ 4,418.90	\$ 4,627.00	\$ 4,539.00	\$ 4,410.00	\$ 4,512.00				\$ 4,680.00					\$ 4,500.00		\$ 4,940.00
	Extended Total			\$ 58,214.00			\$ 57,445.70	\$ 60,151.00	\$ 59,007.00	\$ 57,330.00	\$ 58,656.00				\$ 60,840.00					\$ 58,500.00		\$ 64,220.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# TUBYBB321WC Mfg# YBB321WC			YBB-321WC					Yamaha YBB-321WC							

Bid Tabulation
17-010S - Music Instruments and Equipment RFP

Item #	Description	UOM	QTY	Alamo Music Center	Antonio Strad Violin	B & H Foto and Electronics Corp	Cascio Interstate Music Inc. dba Interstate Music	High School Music Service, Inc	Hilje Music Centers, LLC	Music and Arts Center	Nick Rail Music	Pender's Music Company	Peripole, Inc.	Romeo Music	Sam Ash QuikShip Corp	Suzuki Music USA	Terra Nova Violins	Texas Scenic Company, Inc.	Universal Melody Services	Washington Music Sales Center	Wenger Corporation	Woodwind & Brasswind, Inc.
B.3	Tuba, Yamaha YBB-105 w/ Case or Approved Equal	EA	19		No Bid	No Bid						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each			\$ 2,648.00			\$ 2,587.90	\$ 2,667.00	\$ 2,649.00	\$ 2,580.00	\$ 2,641.00				\$ 2,766.00					\$ 2,634.00		\$ 2,970.00
	Extended Total			\$ 50,312.00			\$ 49,170.10	\$ 50,673.00	\$ 50,331.00	\$ 49,020.00	\$ 50,179.00				\$ 52,554.00					\$ 50,046.00		\$ 56,430.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# TUB1135W Mfg#			YBB-105WC					Yamaha YBB-105WC							
B.4	Tuba, King 1135 w/ Case or Approved Equal	EA	19		No Bid	No Bid						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each			\$ 3,261.00			\$ 3,178.90	\$ 3,329.00	\$ 3,319.00	\$ 3,199.00	\$ 3,397.00				\$ 3,509.00					\$ 3,246.00		\$ 3,650.00
	Extended Total			\$ 61,959.00			\$ 60,399.10	\$ 63,251.00	\$ 63,061.00	\$ 60,781.00	\$ 64,543.00				\$ 66,671.00					\$ 61,674.00		\$ 69,350.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# TUB1135W Mfg# 1135W			1135W					King 1135W							
B.5	Tuba, King 2341 w/ Case or Approved Equal	EA	13		No Bid	No Bid						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each			\$ 4,809.00			\$ 4,724.90	\$ 4,938.00	\$ 4,939.00	\$ 4,762.00	\$ 5,056.00				\$ 5,200.00					\$ 4,831.00		\$ 5,450.00
	Extended Total			\$ 62,517.00			\$ 61,423.70	\$ 64,194.00	\$ 64,207.00	\$ 61,906.00	\$ 65,728.00				\$ 67,600.00					\$ 62,803.00		\$ 70,850.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# TUB2341W Mfg# 2341W			2341W					King 2341W							
B.6	Sousaphone, Conn 20K Silver Plate w/ Case or Approved Equal	EA	6		No Bid	No Bid						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each			\$ 7,029.00			\$ 6,794.90	\$ 6,991.00	\$ 6,999.00	\$ 6,840.00	\$ 7,239.00				\$ 7,400.00					\$ 6,936.00		\$ 7,650.00
	Extended Total			\$ 42,174.00			\$ 40,769.40	\$ 41,946.00	\$ 41,994.00	\$ 41,040.00	\$ 43,434.00				\$ 44,400.00					\$ 41,616.00		\$ 45,900.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# SOU20KSPW Mfg# 20KSPW			20KSPW					Conn 20KSPW							
C. Percussion Instruments																						
C.1	Percussion Kit, Vic Firth V8806 or Approved Equal	EA	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Price per Each						\$ 169.90	\$ 199.00		\$ 218.00					\$ 207.00							\$ 188.00
	Extended Total						\$ 679.60	\$ 796.00		\$ 872.00					\$ 828.00							\$ 752.00
	Brand / Model						DISC - sub Pearl Cascio# BELPK900C Mfg# PK								Vic Firth VFV8806							44761100000000
C.2	Crash Cymbals, Sabian 18" AA Marching Band or Approved Equal	EA	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each						\$ 293.90			\$ 280.00	\$ 297.00				\$ 332.00					\$ 370.00		\$ 262.00
	Extended Total						\$ 1,763.40			\$ 1,680.00	\$ 1,782.00				\$ 1,992.00					\$ 2,220.00		\$ 1,572.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# CYM21822B Mfg# 21822B			Sabian #21822	#21822				Sabian 21822					21822		442814000942000
C.3	Crash Cymbals, Zildjian Stadium 16" or Approved Equal	EA	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each						\$ 266.90			\$ 259.00	\$ 270.00				\$ 291.00					\$ 295.00		\$ 255.00
	Extended Total						\$ 533.80			\$ 518.00	\$ 540.00				\$ 582.00					\$ 590.00		\$ 510.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# CYMA08 Mfg# A0468			Zildjian A0487	#A0468				Zildjian A0468					A0468		471212000905000
C.4	Crash Cymbals, Zildjian Stadium 18" or Approved Equal	EA	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each						\$ 314.90			\$ 306.00	\$ 321.50				\$ 343.00					\$ 350.00		\$ 302.00
	Extended Total						\$ 629.80			\$ 612.00	\$ 643.00				\$ 686.00					\$ 700.00		\$ 604.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# CYMA043 Mfg# A0483			Zildjian A0495	#0483				Zildjian A0483					A0483		471212000906000
C.5	Cymbal Bag, Sabian 22" or Approved Equal	EA	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each						\$ 44.90			\$ 49.00					\$ 68.00					\$ 25.00		\$ 48.00
	Extended Total						\$ 269.40			\$ 294.00					\$ 408.00					\$ 150.00		\$ 288.00
	Brand / Model						Cascio# DC0456 Mfg# 610			Sabian 61008					Sabian 61008					61035		449549000000000

Bid Tabulation
17-010S - Music Instruments and Equipment RFP

Item #	Description	UOM	QTY	Alamo Music Center	Antonio Strad Violin	B & H Foto and Electronics Corp	Cascio Interstate Music Inc. dba Interstate Music	High School Music Service, Inc	Hillje Music Centers, LLC	Music and Arts Center	Nick Rail Music	Pender's Music Company	Peripole, Inc.	Romeo Music	Sam Ash QuikShip Corp	Suzuki Music USA	Terra Nova Violins	Texas Scenic Company, Inc.	Universal Melody Services	Washington Music Sales Center	Wenger Corporation	Woodwind & Brasswind, Inc.
D. String Instruments																						
D.1	Violin, 3/4 size, Bellafina Educator, BEVIA1034OF or Approved Equal	EA	11	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 195.00		\$ 178.90			\$ 254.00	\$ 250.00						\$ 195.00					\$ 290.00
	Extended Total				\$ 2,145.00		\$ 1,967.90			\$ 2,794.00	\$ 2,750.00						\$ 2,145.00					\$ 3,190.00
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 3		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# VLN0022 Mfg# 110VN34/2011				Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLS120 VN-3/4 See Spec Sheets						RN34 STUDIO + Hard Shell Case, Wood Bow Rosin					
D.2	Violin, 4/4 size, Bellafina Educator, BEVIA1044OF or Approved Equal	EA	11	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 195.00		\$ 178.90			\$ 254.00	\$ 250.00						\$ 195.00					\$ 290.00
	Extended Total				\$ 2,145.00		\$ 1,967.90			\$ 2,794.00	\$ 2,750.00						\$ 2,145.00					\$ 3,190.00
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 3		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# VLN0023 Mfg# 110VN44/2011F				Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLS120 VN-4/4 See Spec Sheets						RN44 STUDIO + Hard Shell Case, Wood Bow Rosin					
D.3	Violin, 4/4 size, Eastman Music Co Andreas Eastman VL200, 4/4 size or Approved Equal	EA	16	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 285.00		\$ 223.90	\$ 479.00		\$ 451.00	\$ 430.00						\$ 495.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 4,560.00		\$ 3,582.40	\$ 7,664.00		\$ 7,216.00	\$ 6,880.00						\$ 7,920.00					
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 4H		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# VLN0024 Mfg# 114VN44/2011			Eastman VL200ST outfit	Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLS500VN-4/4 See Spec Sheets						EASTMAN VL200 + Hard Shell Case, Wood Bow Rosin					
D.4	Viola, 12", Bellafina Educator, BEVAA2012OF or Approved Equal	EA	2	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 225.00		\$ 267.90			\$ 297.00	\$ 350.00						\$ 250.00					\$ 390.00
	Extended Total				\$ 450.00		\$ 535.80			\$ 594.00	\$ 700.00						\$ 500.00					\$ 780.00
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 230		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# VLA0018 Mfg# 110VA2/YB910SM/S VC112/30				Sub:MAPLE LEAF MLS120VA-12 See Spec Sheets						RA12 STUDIO + Hard Shell Case, Wood Bow Rosin					
D.5	Viola, 13", Bellafina Educator, BEVAA2013OF or Approved Equal	EA	2	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 225.00		\$ 267.90			\$ 297.00	\$ 350.00						\$ 250.00					\$ 390.00
	Extended Total				\$ 450.00		\$ 535.80			\$ 594.00	\$ 700.00						\$ 500.00					\$ 780.00
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 230		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# VLA0019 Mfg# 110VA3/YB910SM/S VC134				Sub:MAPLE LEAF MLS120VA-13 See Spec Sheets						RA13 STUDIO + Hard Shell Case, Wood Bow Rosin					
D.6	Viola, 15", Bellafina Musicale, BMVAA115OF or Approved Equal	EA	2	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 320.00		\$ 168.90			\$ 187.00	\$ 199.00						\$ 250.00					\$ 390.00
	Extended Total				\$ 640.00		\$ 337.80			\$ 374.00	\$ 398.00						\$ 500.00					\$ 780.00
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 240H		Sub - Palatino Allegro, Cascio# VLAVA45013 Mfg# 110VA5/YB910SM/S VAC115/3				Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLS110VA-15 See Spec Sheets						RA15 STUDIO + Hard Shell Case, Wood Bow Rosin					
D.7	Viola, 15.5 size, Eastman Music Co Andreas Eastman VA200, 14.5 - 15.5 or Approved Equal	EA	4	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 320.00		\$ 293.90			\$ 609.00	\$ 530.00						\$ 595.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 1,280.00		\$ 1,175.60			\$ 2,436.00	\$ 2,120.00						\$ 2,380.00					
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 240		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# VLA0021 Mfg# 114VA15165			VA200ST	Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLSS00VA-15.5 See Spec Sheets						EASTMAN VA200 + Hard Shell Case, Wood Bow Rosin					
D.8	Cello, 1/2 size, Bellafina Prodigy, BPCK3812OF or Approved Equal	EA	5	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 698.00		\$ 443.90			\$ 562.00	\$ 500.00						\$ 800.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 3,490.00		\$ 2,219.50			\$ 2,810.00	\$ 2,500.00						\$ 4,000.00					
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 31 or 32		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# CEL0026 Mfg# 100SH0/101012M				Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLS110C-1/2 See Spec Sheets						RC12 STUDIO + Heavy Padded Bag, Wood Bow Rosin					

Bid Tabulation
17-010S - Music Instruments and Equipment RFP

Item #	Description	UOM	QTY	Alamo Music Center	Antonio Strad Violin	B & H Foto and Electronics Corp	Cascio Interstate Music Inc. dba Interstate Music	High School Music Service, Inc	Hilje Music Centers, LLC	Music and Arts Center	Nick Rail Music	Pender's Music Company	Peripole, Inc.	Romeo Music	Sam Ash QuikShip Corp	Suzuki Music USA	Terra Nova Violins	Texas Scenic Company, Inc.	Universal Melody Services	Washington Music Sales Center	Wenger Corporation	Woodwind & Brasswind, Inc.
D.9	Cello, 3/4 size, Bellafina Prodigy, BPCCK3834OF or Approved Equal	EA	6	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 698.00		\$ 443.90			\$ 562.00	\$ 500.00						\$ 800.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 4,188.00		\$ 2,663.40			\$ 3,372.00	\$ 3,000.00						\$ 4,800.00					
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 32		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# CEL0027 Mfg# 100ST0/101034				Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLS110C-3/4 See Spec Sheets						RC34 STUDIO + Heavy Padded Bag, Wood Bow Rosin					
D.10	Cello, 3/4 size, Bellafina Sonata, BVC7534OF or Approved Equal	EA	1	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 698.00		\$ 523.90			\$ 668.00	\$ 500.00						\$ 800.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 698.00		\$ 523.90			\$ 4,008.00	\$ 500.00						\$ 800.00					
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 32		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# CEL0027.5 Mfg# 100ST0/101034M				Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLS110C-3/4 See Spec Sheets						RC34 STUDIO + Heavy Padded Bag, Wood Bow Rosin					
D.11	Cello, 3/4 size, Eastman Music Co Andreas Eastman VC90, 3/4 size or Approved Equal	EA	4	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 725.00		\$ 514.90			\$ 560.00	\$ 525.00						\$ 695.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 2,900.00		\$ 2,059.60			\$ 560.00	\$ 2,100.00						\$ 2,780.00					
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 32		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# CEL0028 Mfg# 100ST0/101034M/401H34			Eastman VC95ST outfit	Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLS120C-3/4 See Spec Sheets						EASTMAN VC90 + Heavy Padded Bag, Wood Bow Rosin					
D.12	Cello, 4/4 size, Bellafina Prodigy, BPCCK3844OF or Approved Equal	EA	2	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 725.00		\$ 443.90			\$ 562.00	\$ 500.00						\$ 800.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 1,450.00		\$ 887.80			\$ 1,124.00	\$ 1,000.00						\$ 1,600.00					
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 32		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# CEL0029 Mfg# 100SF0/101044M				Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLS110C-4/4 See Spec Sheets						RC44 STUDIO + Heavy Padded Bag, Wood Bow Rosin					
D.13	Cello, 4/4 size, Eastman Music Co Andreas Eastman VC100, 4/4 size or Approved Equal	EA	4	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 725.00		\$ 644.90	\$ 710.00		\$ 702.00	\$ 660.00						\$ 795.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 2,900.00		\$ 2,579.60	\$ 2,840.00		\$ 2,808.00	\$ 2,640.00						\$ 3,180.00					
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 32		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# CEL0030 Mfg# 154SF0/101044M/401H44			Eastman VC100ST outfit	Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLS140C-4/4 See Spec Sheets						EASTMAN VC100 + Heavy Padded Bag, Wood Bow Rosin					
D.14	Cello, 4/4 size, Eastman Music Co Andreas Eastman VC90, 4/4 size or Approved Equal	EA	10	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 725.00		\$ 644.90			\$ 560.00	\$ 525.00						\$ 695.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 7,250.00		\$ 6,449.00			\$ 5,600.00	\$ 5,250.00						\$ 6,950.00					
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 32		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# CEL0031 Mfg# 154SF0/101044M/401H44			Eastman VC95ST outfit	Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLS120C-4/4 See Spec Sheets						EASTMAN VC90 + Heavy Padded Bag, Wood Bow Rosin					
D.15	String Bass, 1/2 size, Antonio Strad Model 53, 1/2 size or Approved Equal	EA	2	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 1,150.00		\$ 947.90										\$ 1,400.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 2,300.00		\$ 1,895.80										\$ 2,800.00					
	Brand / Model				as required		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# BVL0011 Mfg# 1200H0 /YBJ6103										RBCL12 STUDIO + Heavy Padded Bag, Wood or Fiberglass Bow Rosin					

Bid Tabulation
17-010S - Music Instruments and Equipment RFP

Item #	Description	UOM	QTY	Alamo Music Center	Antonio Strad Violin	B & H Foto and Electronics Corp	Cascio Interstate Music Inc. dba Interstate Music	High School Music Service, Inc	Hilje Music Centers, LLC	Music and Arts Center	Nick Rail Music	Pender's Music Company	Peripole, Inc.	Romeo Music	Sam Ash QuikShip Corp	Suzuki Music USA	Terra Nova Violins	Texas Scenic Company, Inc.	Universal Melody Services	Washington Music Sales Center	Wenger Corporation	Woodwind & Brasswind, Inc.
D.16	String Bass, 1/2 size, Christopher Academy, DB102 (Gamba), 1/2 size, semi-gloss or Approved Equal	EA	7	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 1,285.00		\$ 889.90										\$ 1,400.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 8,995.00		\$ 6,229.30										\$ 9,800.00					
	Brand / Model				as required or Strad 53		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# BVL0012 Mfg# 1200H0										RBL12 STUDIO + Heavy Padded Bag, Wood or Fiberglass Bow Rosin					
D.17	String Bass, 1/2 size, Eastman Music Co, Andreas Eastman VB305, 1/2 size or Approved Equal	EA	6	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 1,899.00		\$ 1,777.90	\$ 2,695.00		\$ 2,589.00							\$ 2,495.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 11,394.00		\$ 10,667.40	\$ 16,170.00		\$ 15,534.00							\$ 14,970.00					
	Brand / Model				Strad Model 66		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# BVL0013 Mfg# 1308H8A			Eastman VB305ST outfit							EASTMAN VB305 + Heavy Padded Bag, Wood or Fiberglass Bow Rosin					
D.18	String Bass, 1/4 size, Bellafina Musicale, BMBA4014OF or Approved Equal	EA	2	No Bid		No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 1,150.00		\$ 988.90			\$ 1,014.00	\$ 1,199.00						\$ 850.00					\$ 1,150.00
	Extended Total				\$ 2,300.00		\$ 1,977.80			\$ 2,028.00	\$ 2,398.00						\$ 1,700.00					\$ 2,300.00
	Brand / Model				Strad 53		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# BVL0014 Mfg# 1200Q0/YBH61014 M			Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLS110B-1/4 See Spec Sheets							RBL14 STUDIO + Heavy Padded Bag, Wood or Fiberglass Bow Rosin					J05778000001000
D.19	String Bass, 1/4 size, Christopher Academy, DB102 (Gamba), 1/4 size, semi-gloss or Approved Equal	EA	7	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 1,285.00						\$ 1,199.00						\$ 850.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 8,995.00						\$ 8,393.00						\$ 5,950.00					
	Brand / Model				as required					Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLS110B-1/4 See Spec Sheets							RBL14 STUDIO + Heavy Pa					
D.20	String Bass, 3/4 size, Antonio Strad Cristobal Bass, 3/4 size or Approved Equal	EA	2	No Bid		No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 2,420.00		\$ 1,394.90				\$ 1,199.00						\$ 850.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 4,840.00		\$ 2,789.80				\$ 2,398.00						\$ 1,700.00					
	Brand / Model				as required		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# BVL0015 Mfg# 1302T1AA			Sub: MAPLE LEAF MLS110B-3/4 See Spec Sheets							RBL34 STUDIO + Heavy Pa					
D.21	String Bass, 3/4 size, Eastman Music Co Andreas Eastman VB305, 3/4 size or Approved Equal	EA	6	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each				\$ 2,420.00		\$ 1,777.90	\$ 2,895.00		\$ 2,784.00							\$ 2,695.00					
	Extended Total				\$ 14,520.00		\$ 10,667.40	\$ 17,370.00		\$ 16,704.00							\$ 16,170.00					
	Brand / Model				Strad Cristobal		Sub - Knilling, Cascio# BVL0016 Mfg# 1308T8A			Eastman VB305ST outfit							EASTMAN VB305 + Heavy Pa					
E. Elementary Music Instruments																						
E.1	Soprano/Alto Table, Peripole P1701 or Approved Equal	EA	19	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 117.90							\$ 204.59								
	Extended Total						\$ 2,240.10							\$ 3,887.21								
	Brand / Model						SUB Kinder Last stand Cascio# SSS59 Mfg# G															

Bid Tabulation
17-010S - Music Instruments and Equipment RFP

Item #	Description	UOM	QTY	Alamo Music Center	Antonio Strad Violin	B & H Foto and Electronics Corp	Cascio Interstate Music Inc. dba Interstate Music	High School Music Service, Inc	Hilje Music Centers, LLC	Music and Arts Center	Nick Rail Music	Pender's Music Company	Peripole, Inc.	Romeo Music	Sam Ash QuikShip Corp	Suzuki Music USA	Terra Nova Violins	Texas Scenic Company, Inc.	Universal Melody Services	Washington Music Sales Center	Wenger Corporation	Woodwind & Brasswind, Inc.	
E.2	Bass Table, Peripole P1702 or Approved Equal	EA	3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 133.90						\$ 222.78										
	Extended Total						\$ 401.70						\$ 668.34										
	Brand / Model						SUB Kinder Last stand Cascio# 555592 Mfg#																
E.3	Alto Glockenspiel, Studio 49 200788 or Approved Equal	EA	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 171.90			\$ 197.00	\$ 175.00		\$ 168.21		\$ 174.00						\$ 190.00		
	Extended Total						\$ 343.80			\$ 394.00	\$ 350.00		\$ 336.42		\$ 348.00						\$ 380.00		
	Brand / Model						Cascio# EM078 Mfg# AGD			Studio 49 Agd					Sonor Agd						AGD		
E.4	Alto Metallophone, Peripole P1311 or Approved Equal	EA	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid		No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 372.90				\$ 350.00		\$ 563.85		\$ 375.00								
	Extended Total						\$ 745.80				\$ 700.00		\$ 1,127.70		\$ 750.00								
	Brand / Model						SUB SONOR, DIATONIC SHOWN Cascio# EM059 Mfg# AMP11				Sub: Sonor MA GB See Spec Sheets				Studio 49 AM 1600								
E.5	Soprano Metallophone, Peripole P1301 or Approved Equal	EA	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid		No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 282.90				\$ 275.00		\$ 422.87		\$ 275.00								
	Extended Total						\$ 565.80				\$ 550.00		\$ 845.74		\$ 550.00								
	Brand / Model						SUB SONOR, DIATONIC SHOWN Cascio# EM487 Mfg# SMP11				Sub: Sonor MS GB See Spec Sheets				Studio 49 SM 1600								
E.6	Sub Contra Bass Bar C, Peripole P1401 or Approved Equal	EA	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 434.90				\$ 399.00		\$ 420.71		\$ 475.00								
	Extended Total						\$ 434.90				\$ 399.00		\$ 420.71		\$ 475.00								
	Brand / Model						SUB SONOR Cascio# EM031C Mfg# NKS100				Sub Sonor KSP 100 X See Spec Sheets				Orff NKS 100P C								
E.7	Sub Contra Bass Bar D, Peripole P1402 or Approved Equal	EA	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 434.90				\$ 399.00		\$ 420.71		\$ 475.00								
	Extended Total						\$ 434.90				\$ 399.00		\$ 420.71		\$ 475.00								
	Brand / Model						SUB SONOR Cascio# EM031D Mfg# NKS1				Sub Sonor KSP 100 X See Spec Sheets				Orff NKS 100P D								
E.8	Sub Contra Bass Bar E, Peripole P1403 or Approved Equal	EA	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 434.90				\$ 399.00		\$ 420.71		\$ 475.00								
	Extended Total						\$ 434.90				\$ 399.00		\$ 420.71		\$ 475.00								
	Brand / Model						SUB SONOR Cascio# EM031E Mfg# NKS1				Sub Sonor KSP 100 X See Spec Sheets				Orff NKS 100P E								
E.9	Contra Bass Bar F, Peripole P1404 or Approved Equal	EA	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid		No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 267.90				\$ 310.00		\$ 345.57		\$ 292.00								
	Extended Total						\$ 267.90				\$ 310.00		\$ 345.57		\$ 292.00								
	Brand / Model						SUB SONOR Cascio# EM037F Mfg# NKS6				Sub Sonor KSP 60 X See Spec Sheets				Orff NKS 60P F								
E.10	Contra Bass Bar G, Peripole P1405 or Approved Equal	EA	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid		No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 267.90				\$ 310.00		\$ 345.57		\$ 292.00								
	Extended Total						\$ 267.90				\$ 310.00		\$ 345.57		\$ 292.00								
	Brand / Model						SUB SONOR Cascio# EM037G Mfg# NKS60P				Sub Sonor KSP 60 X See Spec Sheets				Orff NKS 60P G								

Bid Tabulation
17-010S - Music Instruments and Equipment RFP

Item #	Description	UOM	QTY	Alamo Music Center	Antonio Strad Violin	B & H Foto and Electronics Corp	Cascio Interstate Music Inc. dba Interstate Music	High School Music Service, Inc	Hilje Music Centers, LLC	Music and Arts Center	Nick Rail Music	Pender's Music Company	Peripole, Inc.	Romeo Music	Sam Ash QuikShip Corp	Suzuki Music USA	Terra Nova Violins	Texas Scenic Company, Inc.	Universal Melody Services	Washington Music Sales Center	Wenger Corporation	Woodwind & Brasswind, Inc.
E.11	Contra Bass Bar A, Peripole P1406 or Approved Equal	EA	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid		No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 267.90				\$ 310.00		\$ 345.57		\$ 292.00							
	Extended Total						\$ 267.90				\$ 310.00		\$ 345.57		\$ 292.00							
	Brand / Model						SUB SONOR Cascio# EM037A Mfg# NKS				Sub Sonor KSP 60 X See Spec Sheets				Orff NKS 60P A							
E.12	Contra Bass Bar B, Peripole P1407 or Approved Equal	EA	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid		No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 267.90				\$ 310.00		\$ 345.57		\$ 292.00							
	Extended Total						\$ 267.90				\$ 310.00		\$ 345.57		\$ 292.00							
	Brand / Model						SUB SONOR Cascio# EM037B Mfg# NKS60PB				Sub Sonor KSP 60 X See Spec Sheets				Orff NKS 60P B							
E.13	Contra Bass Bar Hi C, Peripole P1408 or Approved Equal	EA	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 421.90						\$ 300.09									
	Extended Total						\$ 421.90						\$ 300.09									
	Brand / Model						SUB SONOR Cascio# EM258C Mfg# NKS100															
E.14	Tubano Pack, Remo 204897 or Approved Equal	EA	3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 340.90			\$ 319.00	\$ 339.00				\$ 345.00						\$ 395.00	
	Extended Total						\$ 1,022.70			\$ 957.00	\$ 1,017.00				\$ 1,035.00						\$ 1,185.00	
	Brand / Model					Cascio# DRSDPVSTUCC Mfg# DPVSTUCC			Remo DP-VSTU-CC-CST	DP-VSTU-CC-CST					Remo DP-VSTU-CC						DP-VSTU-CC-CST	
F. Digital Keyboards																						
F.1	Keyboard, Yamaha HD-200 or Approved Equal	EA	1		No Bid	No Bid						No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Price per Each			\$ 950.00			\$ 883.90	\$ 945.00	\$ 919.00	\$ 989.00	\$ 876.00			\$ 980.00	\$ 915.00						\$ 977.00	\$ 988.00
	Extended Total			\$ 950.00			\$ 883.90	\$ 945.00	\$ 919.00	\$ 989.00	\$ 876.00			\$ 980.00	\$ 915.00						\$ 977.00	\$ 988.00
	Brand / Model					Cascio# SYSHD200 Mfg# HD20									Yamaha HD-200							
F.2	Keyboard, Korg Kronos or Approved Equal	EA	1		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each			\$ 3,049.00			\$ 2,664.90			\$ 3,379.00				\$ 3,350.00	\$ 2,883.00						\$ 1,456.00	
	Extended Total			\$ 3,049.00			\$ 2,664.90			\$ 3,379.00				\$ 3,350.00	\$ 2,883.00						\$ 1,456.00	
	Brand / Model					Cascio# SYSKRONOSNEW8 8 Mfg# KRONOS8				Korg Kronos8					Korg Kronos V3 88 Key						Kronos2	
F.3	Keyboard, Yamaha MOXF8 or Approved Equal	EA	1		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid				No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each			\$ 1,439.00			\$ 1,347.90	\$ 1,399.00		\$ 1,513.00	\$ 1,346.00			\$ 1,390.00	\$ 1,470.00						\$ 1,385.00	
	Extended Total			\$ 1,439.00			\$ 1,347.90	\$ 1,399.00		\$ 1,513.00	\$ 1,346.00			\$ 1,390.00	\$ 1,470.00						\$ 1,385.00	
	Brand / Model					Cascio# SYSMOXF8 Mfg# MOXF									Yamaha MOXF-8							
G. Instrument Storage and Classroom Equipment																						
G.1	Music Chair Rack, Wenger #127A261 or Approved Equal	EA	7	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Price per Each																					\$ 255.00
	Extended Total																					\$ 1,785.00
	Brand / Model																					
G.2	Music Stand Rack, Wenger #039C202 or Approved Equal	EA	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 296.90															\$ 389.00
	Extended Total						\$ 1,781.40															\$ 2,334.00
	Brand / Model					SUB MANHASSET Cascio# MS019 Mfg# 1910																

Bid Tabulation
17-010S - Music Instruments and Equipment RFP

Item #	Description	UOM	QTY	Alamo Music Center	Antonio Strad Violin	B & H Foto and Electronics Corp	Cascio Interstate Music Inc. dba Interstate Music	High School Music Service, Inc	Hilje Music Centers, LLC	Music and Arts Center	Nick Rail Music	Pender's Music Company	Peripole, Inc.	Romeo Music	Sam Ash QuikShip Corp	Suzuki Music USA	Terra Nova Violins	Texas Scenic Company, Inc.	Universal Melody Services	Washington Music Sales Center	Wenger Corporation	Woodwind & Brasswind, Inc.	
G.3	Band Chairs, Wenger #0936121 or Approved Equal	EA	60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each																						\$ 72.00
	Extended Total																						\$ 4,320.00
G.4	Music Stands, Wenger #039E500 or Approved Equal	EA	15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 29.94																\$ 58.00
	Extended Total						\$ 449.10																\$ 870.00
G.5	Seated Choral Risers, Capacity 51-60, Wenger Stagetek, Set #135 Approved Equal. ** Price to include Delivery and Setup / Installation directly at: Samuel Clemens High School, 1001 Elbel Rd, Schertz, TX 78154	EA	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each																						\$ 18,586.00
	Extended Total																						\$ 18,586.00
G.6	Flip Form Risers, Wenger #025D027 or Approved Equal	EA	33	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each																						\$ 920.00
	Extended Total																						\$ 30,360.00
G.7	Violin/Viola Rack, Cherry Finish, Fits up to 16 Violins/Violas, Wenger #148J005.103 or Approved Equal	EA	3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 664.90																\$ 883.00
	Extended Total						\$ 1,994.70																\$ 2,649.00
G.8	Cello Rack, Cherry Finish, Fits up to 6 Cellos, Wenger #148J002.105 or Approved Equal	EA	3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 584.90																\$ 874.00
	Extended Total						\$ 1,754.70																\$ 2,622.00
G.9	Double Bass Storage Rack, Wenger #148J004.101 or Approved Equal	EA	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 584.90																\$ 856.00
	Extended Total						\$ 1,169.80																\$ 1,712.00
H. Band Field Equipment																							
H.1	Drum Major Podium, Jarvis 62" Black or Approved Equal	EA	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each						\$ 987.90			\$ 1,185.00													
	Extended Total						\$ 1,975.80			\$ 2,370.00													
H.2	Voice Machine Package, Sound Projections VM2-HBM-HBMDLX or Approved Equal	EA	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS	No Bid	No Bid	
	Price per Each							\$ 2,849.00		\$ 2,830.00			\$ 3,420.00								\$ 2,201.00		
	Extended Total							\$ 5,698.00		\$ 2,830.00			\$ 3,420.00								\$ 2,201.00		
	Brand / Model																				Anchor LTB-DP		

Bid Tabulation
17-010S - Music Instruments and Equipment RFP

Item #	Description	UOM	QTY	Alamo Music Center	Antonio Strad Violin	B & H Foto and Electronics Corp	Cascio Interstate Music Inc. dba Interstate Music	High School Music Service, Inc	Hilje Music Centers, LLC	Music and Arts Center	Nick Rail Music	Pender's Music Company	Peripole, Inc.	Romeo Music	Sam Ash QuikShip Corp	Suzuki Music USA	Terra Nova Violins	Texas Scenic Company, Inc.	Universal Melody Services	Washington Music Sales Center	Wenger Corporation	Woodwind & Brasswind, Inc.
H.3	Voice Machine Package, Sound Projections VM2-HBM or Approved Equal	EA	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each							\$ 1,799.00		\$ 1,976.00				\$ 1,880.00							\$ 2,241.00	
	Extended Total							\$ 1,799.00		\$ 1,976.00				\$ 1,880.00							\$ 2,241.00	
	Brand / Model									Voice Machine ELVM1X											Anchor LIB-DUAL	
I. Electronic Equipment																						
I.1	PA System, Kustom Profile 200 or Approved Equal	EA	3		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each			\$ 525.00						\$ 449.00												
	Extended Total			\$ 1,575.00						\$ 1,347.00												
	Brand / Model																					
I.2	Portable Sound System, Fender Passport Event #6946000000 or Approved Equal	EA	1		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each			\$ 569.00			\$ 544.90			\$ 583.00				\$ 580.00	\$ 510.00						\$ 579.00	
	Extended Total			\$ 569.00			\$ 544.90			\$ 583.00				\$ 580.00	\$ 510.00						\$ 579.00	
	Brand / Model						Cascio# SRS6946000000 Mfg# 6946000000								Fender Passport Event							
I.3	Digital Recorder, Roland R-09 or Approved Equal	EA	6		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each			\$ 189.00			\$ 162.90			\$ 159.00				\$ 175.00							\$ 157.00	
	Extended Total			\$ 1,134.00			\$ 977.40			\$ 954.00				\$ 1,050.00							\$ 942.00	
	Brand / Model			Roland R-05			SUB, Newer Model Cascio# SRSR05 Mfg# R05			#R-05 See Spec Sheets				R-05 new model							R-05	
J. Theater Lighting Equipment																						
J.1	Ellipsoidal, ETC Source Four or Approved Equal	EA	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each																				\$ 336.00	
	Extended Total																				\$ 3,360.00	
	Brand / Model																				19, 26, 36, or 50 degree lenses only. C-Clamp included, but lamp and connector are not included	
J.2	Fresnel, Altman 75Q or Approved Equal	EA	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each																				\$ 246.00	
	Extended Total																				\$ 2,460.00	
	Brand / Model																				C-Clamp, lamp, and connector are not included	
J.3	Sky Cyc Lights, Altman SKY-CYC-03 or Approved Equal	EA	3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Price per Each																				\$ 1,004.00	
	Extended Total																				\$ 3,012.00	
	Brand / Model																				Lamp and connector are not included	

Not As Specified (NAS):

Item #	Note
C.1	Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
D.1	Lower bids did not meet specifications
D.2	Lower bids did not meet specifications
D.3	Lower bids did not meet specifications
D.4	Lower bids did not meet specifications
D.5	Lower bids did not meet specifications
D.6	Lower bids did not meet specifications
D.7	Lower bids did not meet specifications
D.8	Nick Rail and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
D.9	Nick Rail and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
D.10	Nick Rail and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
D.11	Nick Rail and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
D.12	Nick Rail and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
D.13	Nick Rail and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
D.14	Nick Rail did not meet specifications
D.15	Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
D.16	Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
D.17	Antonio Strad and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
D.18	Terra Nova and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
D.19	Nick Rail and Terra Nova did not meet specifications
D.20	Lower bids did not meet specifications
D.21	Antonio Strad and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
E.1	Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
E.2	Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
E.4	Nick Rail, Sam Ash, and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
E.5	Nick Rail, Sam Ash, and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
E.6	Nick Rail did not meet specifications
E.7	Nick Rail did not meet specifications
E.8	Nick Rail did not meet specifications
E.9	Nick Rail, Sam Ash, and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
E.10	Nick Rail, Sam Ash, and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
E.11	Nick Rail, Sam Ash, and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
E.12	Nick Rail, Sam Ash, and Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
F.2	Washington Music Sales did not meet specifications
G.2	Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
G.4	Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
G.7	Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
G.8	Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
G.9	Cascio Interstate Music did not meet specifications
H.2	Washington Music Sales did not meet specifications